
ITB 139-19

1 1” 100 NO BID  $                        106.73  $                  10,673.00  $       106.68  $                     10,668.00 

2 1 ¼” 5 NO BID  $                        106.73  $                       533.65  $       106.68  $                          533.40 

3 1 1/2" 100 NO BID  $                        113.31  $                  11,331.00  $       113.31  $                     11,331.00 

4 1 3/4" 5 NO BID  $                        113.97  $                       569.85  $       113.97  $                          569.85 

5 2" 600 NO BID  $                        114.10  $                  68,460.00  $       114.10  $                     68,460.00 

6 2 ¼” 5 NO BID  $                        114.10  $                       570.50  $       114.10  $                          570.50 

7 2 ½” 5 NO BID  $                        114.25  $                       571.25  $       114.25  $                          571.25 

8 3” 5 NO BID  $                        116.62  $                       583.10  $       116.62  $                          583.10 

9 3 ¼” 5 NO BID  $                        118.00  $                       590.00  $       118.00  $                          590.00 

10 3 ½” 5 NO BID  $                        122.60  $                       613.00  $       122.60  $                          613.00 

11 3 ¾” 5 NO BID  $                        129.00  $                       645.00  $       129.00  $                          645.00 

12 3” 5 NO BID  $                        116.62  $                       583.10  $       116.62  $                          583.10 

13 4” 5 NO BID  $                        125.66  $                       628.30  $       125.66  $                          628.30 

14 4 ¼” 5 NO BID  $                        129.90  $                       649.50  $       129.90  $                          649.50 

15 4 ½” 5 NO BID  $                        131.00  $                       655.00  $       131.00  $                          655.00 

16 4 ¾” 5 NO BID  $                        136.52  $                       682.60  $       136.52  $                          682.60 

17 5” 5 NO BID  $                        146.65  $                       733.25  $       146.65  $                          733.25 

18 5 ¼” 5 NO BID  $                        159.00  $                       795.00  $       158.00  $                          790.00 

19 5 ½” 5 NO BID  $                        169.60  $                       848.00  $       168.60  $                          843.00 

20 5 ¾” 5 NO BID  $                        179.10  $                       895.50  $       178.10  $                          890.50 

21 6” 5 NO BID  $                        199.60  $                       998.00  $       198.60  $                          993.00 

22 6 ¼” 5 NO BID  $                        231.50  $                    1,157.50  $       230.50  $                       1,152.50 

23 6 ½” 5 NO BID  $                        231.50  $                    1,157.50  $       230.50  $                       1,152.50 

24 6 ¾” 5 NO BID  $                        233.00  $                    1,165.00  $       232.00  $                       1,160.00 

25 7” 5 NO BID  $                        240.00  $                    1,200.00  $       239.00  $                       1,195.00 

26 7 ¼” 5 NO BID  $                        265.70  $                    1,328.50  $       264.70  $                       1,323.50 

27 7 ½” 5 NO BID  $                        276.10  $                    1,380.50  $       275.10  $                       1,375.50 

28 7¾” 5 NO BID  $                        277.60  $                    1,388.00  $       276.60  $                       1,383.00 

29 8” 5 NO BID  $                        283.66  $                    1,418.30  $       281.66  $                       1,408.30 

30  9” 5 NO BID  $                        295.00  $                    1,475.00  $       293.00  $                       1,465.00 

31 10" 5 NO BID  $                        396.00  $                    1,980.00  $       394.00  $                       1,970.00 

32 11" 5 NO BID  $                        408.00  $                    2,040.00  $       406.00  $                       2,030.00 

33 12" 5 NO BID  $                        460.50  $                    2,302.50  $       458.50  $                       2,292.50 

34 13” 5 NO BID  $                        492.00  $                    2,460.00  $       490.00  $                       2,450.00 

35 14” 5 NO BID  $                        520.70  $                    2,603.50  $       518.70  $                       2,593.50 

36 15” 5 NO BID  $                        543.60  $                    2,718.00  $       541.60  $                       2,708.00 

 $        128,382.90  $            128,242.65 

Delivery of manhole riser rings are guaranteed not later than __ days after order placed.

1.PORT CITY PIPE INC./P.O. BOX 850356 MOBILE AL 36685 /CONTACT: DANIEL R. SMITH /PH: 1 (800) 959-6921 FAX: (251) 607-0358 EMAIL: REGGIE@PORTCITYPIPE.COM

PRICE PER 
EACH   3 
YEARS

EXTENDED PRICE

NOTE: 6" to 15" Risers are solid and carry a ________ week(s) lead time. 4 to 6 
14

"NEGOTIATED BID"

GRAND TOTAL

PORT CITY PIPE INC.

Bid Tabulation

MANHOLE RISER RINGS
Sandra Tellis, Principal Buyer
telliss@jccal.org

LINE ITEM NO.

205-325-5382

 EXPANDABLE RINGS 
(HEIGHT)

PRICE PER EACH   3 
YEARS EXTENDED PRICEAPPROXIMATE 

QUANTITY PRICE PER EACH (1 YEAR) 

Non-Collusion Affidavit

Notification of Intent to Respond YES

Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd year  ___ % 0%
Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd year  ___ % 0%

YES
EEOC Form
Debarment Statement
Affidavit of Contractor (E-Verify)
Signature Page

CONTACTS:

YES
YES
YES
YES

AMERICAN HIGHWAY 
PRODUCTS

Manufacturer name of equipment being bid by your company

YESExperience Statement

MAXIMUM DISCOUNT
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